
Legal Notice 

IF YOU PURCHASED A HUSQVARNA GAS-POWERED GRASS TRIMMER WITH MODEL NUMBERS 
130C, 130L, OR 330LK, YOU MAY BE ENTITLED TO A $45 VOUCHER AND EXTENDED WARRANTY 

FROM A CLASS ACTION SETTLEMENT

A settlement has been proposed in a class action lawsuit alleging that certain models of Husqvarna gas-powered 
grass trimmers with model numbers 130C, 130L, and 330LK (“Class Products”) sold prior to November 13, 2023, 
were defective. The settlement will provide, subject to certain requirements, (1) a $45 voucher per Class Product, 2) 
a one-year extension to the limited product warranty, and 3) a three-year extension of the limited product warranty 
for parts and labor only on the ignition module only for Class Products. To receive the voucher, you must file a 
claim form by January 2, 2026. 

The United States District Court for the Western District of North Carolina authorized this notice. Before any 
benefits are provided, the Court will have a hearing to decide whether to approve the settlement. To receive more 
information about the settlement, you can get a detailed notice and other information, including details on how to 
object and/or exclude yourself from the settlement, by visiting www.grasstrimmersettlement.com, calling 1-888-
463-7662, and writing to Husqvarna Settlement, c/o RG/2 Claims Administration LLC, P.O. Box 59479, 
Philadelphia, PA 19102-9479.

WHO IS INCLUDED IN THE PROPOSED SETTLEMENT? 

All persons in the United States (including its states, districts or territories) who purchased a Class Product during 
the Class Period. The “Class Products” are Husqvarna gas-powered grass string trimmers model numbers 130C 
(SKU # 970514301, 970514302, 970514303, 970694601, 970694701), 130L (SKU # 970514401, 970514402, 
970514403, 970694801, 970694901), and 330LK (SKU # 970514501, 970514502, 970514503, 970514504, 
970545001) sold on or before November 13, 2023. Purchasers/owners who have already had Consumer Product 
Safety Commission Recall Number: 24-113 (“CPSC Recall”) performed on their grass strong trimmers on or before  
October 3, 2025 are not included. 

WHAT DOES THE PROPOSED SETTLEMENT PROVIDE? 

The settlement provides entitlement to warranty extensions and vouchers to resolve the lawsuit. If approved by the 
Court, the settlement will provide (1) a $45 voucher per Class Product that is brought in for repair/replacement of 
the ignition module per the CPSC Recall at an authorized Husqvarna dealer within 90 days of  October 3, 2025, 
provided that Class Members submit a claim form on or by January 2, 2026, (2) a one-year extension to the limited 
product warranty to Settlement Class Members that bring in their Class Product for a repair/replacement of the 
ignition module per the CPSC Recall at an authorized Husqvarna dealer within one year of October 3, 2025, (3) a 
three-year extension of the limited product warranty for parts and labor on the ignition module for Class Products 
that are brought in for a repair/replacement of the ignition module per the CPSC Recall at an authorized Husqvarna 
dealer within one year of October 3, 2025, and (4) Settlement Administration Expenses, (5) an Incentive Award to 
Class Representative, and  (6) Attorneys’ Fees and Expenses. 

TO SUBMIT A CLAIM FORM, GO TO WWW.GRASSTRIMMERSETTLEMENT.COM. 

HOW DO I PARTICIPATE IN THE RECALL? 

To participate in the CPSC Recall, you must schedule a free repair through a Husqvarna authorized dealer. You 
should call the closest or most convenient Husqvarna dealer to schedule your repair, or bring in the grass trimmer 
during open business hours. For questions about the recall, you may call Husqvarna toll-free at 877-257-6921 from 
8 a.m. to 7 p.m. ET, Monday through Friday, or email 
recalls@husqvarnagroup.com. The CPSC Recall page, which contains more information about the recall, can be 
found at https://www.cpsc.gov/Recalls/2024/Husqvarna-Recalls-Grass-Trimmers-Due-to-Fire-Hazard 

WHO REPRESENTS YOU? 

The Court appointed the law firms of Smith Krivoshey, PC and Milberg Coleman Bryson Phillips Grossman, PLLC 
to represent you as Class Counsel.  

QUESTIONS? VISIT WWW.GRASSTRIMMERSETTLEMENT.COM OR CALL 1-888-463-7662 
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WHAT ARE YOUR OPTIONS? 

If you are a Class Member, you may (1) do nothing; (2) exclude yourself; (3) have the CPSC recall performed on 
your product and avail yourself of the benefits provided for under and in accordance with the requirements spelled 
out in the Settlement Agreement (including complying with deadlines with respect to the voucher and extended 
warranty relief) and, with respect to the voucher, timely send in a Claim Form; (4) object to the settlement; and/or 
(5) go to a hearing about the fairness of the settlement.

If you do not want to be legally bound by the settlement, you must exclude yourself by letter postmarked by 
December 2, 2025. The detailed “Long Form” notice available at www.grasstrimmersettlement.com explains how 
to exclude yourself or object. You may also call 1-888-463-7662  for details.  

The Court will hold a hearing in this case on February 2, 2026 at 10:00 a.m. in the United States District Court of 
the Western District of North Carolina, 6300 Charles R. Jonas Federal Bldg., 401 W. Trade Street, Charlotte, NC 
28202. At this hearing, the Court will consider whether to approve the settlement and whether to approve Class 
Counsel’s application for attorneys’ fees, expenses, and incentive award.  

You may appear at the hearing, but you do not have to. You do not need to retain an attorney to appear at the 
hearing, but you have the right to do so.  


